
Item Package type Preferred Vendor/ Item # Price Notes Price Notes Price Notes Price Notes
Pediatric Bulb Syringe - STERILE Each Busse Hospital / 590031 1.10$           0.85$           Quote-not preferred
Adult BVM w/oxygen reservoir bag & Manometer  with 
B/V filter Each Curaplex /2442-BVMPAD 15.23$        30.62$        Quote-not preferred
Neonate BVM mask  with B/V filter Each Curaplex 10.06$        16.21$        Quote-not preferred
Infant BVM w/oxygen reservoir bag & Manometer   
with B/V filter Each Curaplex 18.31$        24.19$        Quote-not preferred
Pediatric BVM  w/oxygen reservoir bag & Manometer  
with B/V filter Each Curaplex 18.31$        24.52$        Quote-not preferred
CPAP-O2 MAX BiTrac ED Mask, w/Neb, Adult Med, w/3-
set Valve, Ohmeda Connector, Fixed Flow Box of 10 Pulmodyne 54.68$        

BiTrac ED Mask and Head Strap, Adult, Large Each Pulmodyne 24.54$        33.73$        Quote-not preferred
ET Tube 2.5 mm Cuffed with Stylette each 1.47$           No Bid
ET Tube 3.0 mm Cuffed with Stylette each 1.47$           No Bid
ET Tube 3.5 mm Cuffed with Stylette each 1.47$           No Bid
ET Tube 4.0 mm Cuffed with Stylette each 1.47$           No Bid
ET Tube 4.5 mm Cuffed with Stylette each 1.47$           4.84$           
ET Tube 5.0 mm Cuffed with Stylette each 1.47$           4.84$           
ET Tube 5.5 mm Cuffed with Stylette each 1.47$           No Bid
ET Tube 6.0 mm Cuffed with Stylette each 1.47$           5.42$           
ET Tube 6.5 mm Cuffed with Stylette each 1.47$           4.84$           
ET Tube 7.0 mm Cuffed with Stylette each 1.47$           4.84$           
ET Tube 7.5 mm Cuffed with Stylette each 1.47$           5.42$           
ET Tube 8.0 mm Cuffed with Stylette each 1.47$           5.42$           
ET Tube Holder - Thomas - Adult Each Laerdal / 020500 3.20$           3.72$           
ET Tube Holder - Thomas - Pediatric Each Laerdal / 020400 3.20$           3.42$           
ET Tube Disposable Introducer - Bougie-Adult Each  (10/box) 5.28$           10.72$        
ET Tube Disposable Introducer - Bougie-Pediatric Each  (10/box) 5.28$           10.72$        
Laryngoscope Blade Mac 2 Disposable  LED Each Sun-Med 3.75$       Quote-not preferred 4.20$           10.23$        Quote-not preferred
Laryngoscope Blade Mac 3 Disposable  LED Each Sun-Med 3.75$       Quote-not preferred 4.20$           13.24$        Quote-not preferred
Laryngoscope Blade Mac 4 Disposable  LED Each Sun-Med 3.75$       Quote-not preferred 4.20$           13.24$        Quote-not preferred
Laryngoscope Blade Mil 1 Disposable  LED Each Sun-Med 3.75$       Quote-not preferred 4.20$           13.84$        Quote-not preferred
Laryngoscope Blade Mil 2 Disposable  LED Each Sun-Med 3.75$       Quote-not preferred 4.20$           13.84$        Quote-not preferred
Laryngoscope Blade Mil 3 Disposable  LED Each Sun-Med 3.75$       Quote-not preferred 4.20$           13.84$        Quote-not preferred
Laryngoscope Blade Mil 4 Disposable  LED Each Sun-Med 3.75$       Quote-not preferred 4.20$           13.84$        Quote-not preferred
Laryngoscope Handle  - Adult   LED Each 55.00$     Quote-not preferred 11.47$        12.12$        
Laryngoscope Handle - Pediatric   LED Each 55.00$     Quote-not preferred 28.21$        7.24$           
Nasal Cannula Adult, w/7' tubing - non-flared Each Curaplex / 30050 0.26$           0.61$           
Nasal Cannula Pediatric, w/7' tubing - non-flared Each Curaplex / 30056 0.28$           1.37$           
Nasopharyngeal Airway 12 Fr,PVC Each Curaplex / 2021-15112 1.80$       Quote-not preferred 1.55$           3.25$           
Nasopharyngeal Airway 14 Fr,PVC Each Curaplex / 2021-15114 1.80$       Quote-not preferred 1.55$           2.22$           
Nasopharyngeal Airway 16 Fr,PVC Each Curaplex/ 2021-15116 1.80$       Quote-not preferred 1.55$           2.22$           
Nasopharyngeal Airway 18 Fr,PVC Each Curaplex / 2021-15116 1.80$       Quote-not preferred 1.55$           2.13$           
Nasopharyngeal Airway 20 Fr,PVC Each Curaplex / 2021-15120 1.80$       Quote-not preferred 1.55$           2.13$           
Nasopharyngeal Airway 22 Fr,PVC Each Curaplex / 202115122 1.80$       Quote-not preferred 1.55$           2.13$           
Nasopharyngeal Airway 24 Fr,PVC Each Curaplex/ 2021-15124 1.80$       Quote-not preferred 1.55$           2.13$           
Nasopharyngeal Airway 26 Fr,PVC Each Curaplex/ 2021-15126 1.80$       Quote-not preferred 1.55$           2.13$           
Nasopharyngeal Airway 28 Fr,PVC Each Curaplex / 2021-15128 1.80$       Quote-not preferred 1.55$           2.13$           
Nasopharyngeal Airway 30 Fr,PVC Each Curaplex / 2021-15130 1.80$       Quote-not preferred 1.55$           2.13$           
Nasopharyngeal Airway 32 Fr,PVC Each Curaplex / 2021-15132 1.80$       Quote-not preferred 1.55$           2.13$           
Nasopharyngeal Airway 34 Fr,PVC Each Curaplex / 2021-15134 1.80$       Quote-not preferred 1.55$           2.13$           
Nasopharyngeal Airway 36 Fr,PVC Each Curaplex / 2021-15136 1.80$       Quote-not preferred 1.55$           2.22$           

NRB Mask Adult - w/safety vent, 750ml bag, 84" tubing Each Curaplex 7.48$           1.35$           
NRB Mask Pediatric - w/safety vent, 750ml bag, 84" 
tubing Each Curaplex 7.48$           No Bid
Orophayngeal Airway 40mm, Berman Each Dynarex 0.20$       Quote-not preferred 0.15$           0.31$           Quote-not preferred
Orophayngeal Airway 50mm, Berman Each Dynarex 0.15$           0.68$           Quote-not preferred
Oropharyngeal Airway 60mm, Berman Each Dynarex 0.20$       Quote-not preferred 0.15$           0.40$           Quote-not preferred
Orophayngeal Airway 70mm,Berman Each Dynarex 0.15$           0.68$           Quote-not preferred
Oropharyngeal Airway 80mm, Berman Each Dynarex 0.20$       Quote-not preferred 0.15$           0.30$           Quote-not preferred
Oropharyngeal Airway 90mm, Berman Each Dynarex 0.20$       Quote-not preferred 0.15$           0.57$           Quote-not preferred
Oropharyngeal Airway 100mm, Berman Each Dynarex 0.20$       Quote-not preferred 0.15$           0.28$           Quote-not preferred
Oxygen Connecting Tubing Box of 50 medline industries 0.65$           0.41$           Quote-not preferred
Micro Mist®  small Volume Nebulizer Kit, 6 ml with Tee 
Piece, Mouthpiece, Reservoir Tube, Oxygen Tubing, 
Universal Connector Each Medline Industries 0.71$           0.95$           Quote-not preferred
Nebulizer with Mask - Adult EA Curaplex / 30557 0.89$           1.56$           
Nebulizer with Mask - Pediatric EA Curaplex/ 30556 0.84$           2.28$           
Stylet w/stopper 6FR ea 0.95$           20.12$        
Stylet Flexi-Slip 14FR (adult) Each 0.95$           4.58$           
Suction Canister - 1200 ml BEMIS # 484410 Each BEMIS 3.51$           3.40$           
Coaxial Vacuum Connector 33cm, 12 pack #780422 Pk Laerdal 16.33$        16.05$        
Suction Catheter 6fr Each Curaplex/ 36090 0.18$           0.23$           
Suction Catheter 8fr Each Curaplex/ 36091 0.18$           0.74$           
Suction Catheter 10fr Each Curaplex/ 36092 0.18$           1.34$           
Suction Catheter 12fr Each Curaplex/ 36093 0.18$           1.34$           
Suction Catheter 14fr Each Curaplex/ 36094 0.18$           1.13$           
Suction Catheter 16fr Each Curaplex/ 36095 0.18$           1.23$           
Suction Catheter 18fr Each Curaplex /36096 0.18$           0.47$           
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i-gel O2 Resus Pack, Size 3 Small Adult (yellow) Each Intersurgical, Inc 25.64$        34.42$        
i-gel O2 Resus Pack, Size 4, Medium Adult (green) Each Intersurgical, Inc 25.64$        34.42$        
i-gel O2 Resus Pack, Size 5 , Large Adult (orange) Each Intersurgical, Inc 25.64$        34.42$        
i- gel 02 Resus Pack, Sizes 1.0 (pink) Each Intersurgical, Inc 15.38$        No Bid
i-gel 02 Resus Pack, size 1.5 (blue) Each Intersurgical, Inc 15.38$        No Bid
i-gel 02 Resus Pack, size2.0 (grey) Each Intersurgical, Inc 15.38$        No Bid
i-gel 02 Resus Pack, size2.5 (white) Each Intersurgical, Inc 15.38$        No Bid
i-gel flexable catheter mount, swivel elbow and 7.6 MM 
port Each Intersurgical, Inc 115.00$      No Bid
Airway Support Strap for I-Gel O2 Each Intersurgical, Inc 6.84$           No Bid
Yankauer Suction Catheter, w/6' tubing &  Control 
Vent, LTS-D KIT each Curaplex/ 533-MS-YK20EA 1.19$           3.19$           
CONTROL-CRIC W/Crick-Knife & Key EA PULMODYNE 183.00$      No Bid
CONTROL-CRIC Training Kit EA PULMODYNE 116.35$      No Bid
Decompression Needle Kit (14GA X 3.25") NAR # ZZ-
0056 EA North American Rescue 9.69$           10.51$        Quote-not preferred
Blunt Plastic Cannula 17 ga  (100/box) Box 0.54$           32.76$        
Blunt Fill Needle 18 ga x 1.25" (100/bx) Box 0.41$           9.53$           
Filter Needle 19g 1-1/2 inch Box of 100 6.66$           61.92$        
Hypodermic Needle-Pro w/Needle Protection Device, 
22 ga x 1.0" Box of 100 Smiths Medical 20.00$        14.60$        Quote-not preferred
Hypodermic Needle-Pro w/Needle Protection Device, 
22 ga x 1.5" Box of 100 Smiths Medical 20.00$        14.60$        Quote-not preferred
IV Ext Set 0.9ml, reg bore w/detachable valve, red 
pinch clamp, sliding spin-lock, 8" ea 1.15$           6.29$           
IV Safety Cath 16 ga x 1.25"      Protectiv® Box of 50 Smiths Medical 1.60$           1.85$           Quote-not preferred
IV Safety Cath 18 ga x 1.25"      Protectiv® Box of 50 Smiths Medical 1.60$           1.34$           Quote-not preferred
IV Safety Cath 20 ga x 1.25"      Protectiv® Box of 50 Smiths Medical 1.60$           0.72$           Quote-not preferred
IV Safety Cath 22 ga x 1.00"      Protectiv® Box of 50 Smiths Medical 1.60$           1.58$           Quote-not preferred
IV Safety Cath 24 ga x 0.75"      Protectiv® Box of 50 Smiths Medical 1.60$           1.85$           Quote-not preferred
IV Administration set - 10 drop SET Box of 50 1.32$           2.95$           
IV 60 Drop Set (1 needless port, 1 needle Port) Box of 50 1.65$           0.98$           
IV Start Kit w/Tegad&Chlorp (+tourn,gz spnge, tape & 
poly pad) Each  1.10$           1.90$           
3 way stopcock Each 1.03$           0.95$           
1 ml syringe w/o needle Luer lock Box of 100 56.92$        27.58$        
3 ml Syringe w/o needle luer lock Box of 100 0.10$           0.10$           
5ml Syringe w/o needle luer lock Box of 100 0.30$           0.11$           
10ml Syringe w/o needle luer lock Box of 100 0.33$           0.14$           
50ml Syringe w/o needle luer lock Box of 100 19.99$        29.47$        
Pinc Zinc Oxide Adhesive Tape, 5yd L  x 0.5 in W case of 36 Medline Industries, Inc 130.73$      74.92$        
Carpuject Holder Each Carpuject 0.02$           0.01$           
Mucosal Atomization Device without syringe Each 5.40$       3.53$           11.09$        
U Body Polypropylene Economy Strap System (Spider 
Straps) Each Dick Medical Supply 19.99$        19.28$        
1 inch TRANSPORE Tape Box of 12 3M 9.62$           7.74$           
2 inch TRANSPORE Tape Box of 6 3M 11.00$        14.69$        
Adhesive Bandage (Band-Aids) Box of 100 Curaplex 1.28$           18.15$        

Conforming Stretch Roll Gauze 2in x 4.1 yds (sterile) Pack of 12 Dynarex 1.52$           3.36$           

Conforming Stretch Roll Gauze 3in x 4.1 yds (sterile) Pack of 12 Dynarex 1.92$           8.02$           

Conforming Stretch Roll Gauze 4in x 4.1 yds (sterile) Pack of 12 Dynarex 2.40$           4.29$           
Gauze Pad - 2x2 - Sterile 12 ply single Pkg of 100 Dynarex 2.76$           0.87$           Quote-not preferred
Gauze Pad - 3x3 - Sterile 12 ply single Pkg of 100 Dynarex 3.47$           1.92$           Quote-not preferred
Gauze Pad - 4x4 - Sterile 12 ply single Pkg of 100 Dynarex 5.79$           2.54$           Quote-not preferred
Trauma Dressing 12in X 30in (Sterile) Each Dynarex 0.91$           2.98$           Quote-not preferred
Triangular Bandage w/2 pins Box of 12 Dynarex 0.42$           34.95$        Quote-not preferred
Vaseline Gauze 3X9 Each Dynarex 0.80$           0.83$           Quote-not preferred
8"x10" Sterile Gauze Pad Box of 20 Dynarex 6.29$           4.92$           Quote-not preferred
Heavy Duty Black Body Bag CS ADI Medical 22.56$        265.23$      
Infant Head Warmer, Knit, Pink and Blue Stripes BX Medline Industries /#442114 0.46$           96.28$        
Alcohol, Rubbing 70% ISO, 16 oz (12 BTL/CS) Each Med Plus Services/ 201001 1.95$           11.75$        
Alcohol Prep Pads Large (1.5x1.75 approx)  2 ply Box of 100 curaplex 1.47$           1.94$           
Magil Forceps  Adult/ Child Each Surgical Design, INC 4.17$           9.94$           Quote-not preferred
Magil Forceps  Child 3.08$           9.94$           Quote-not preferred
Bedpan (disposable) Each Medegen Medical 1.15$           4.74$           
Pediatric Pack, Purple (Pacific Coast) Each R&B Fabrications, INC 247.63$      No Bid
Biohazard Bag - 30 gallon Each Medegen Medical Products 49.00$  50/case 0.19$           0.35$           
Blood Pressure Cuff Adult (Manual) Each Curaplex 6.59$           12.34$        
Blood Pressure Cuff Child (Manual) Each Curaplex 6.59$           17.48$        
Blood Pressure Cuff Infant (Manual) Each Curaplex 6.50$           26.01$        
Blood Pressure Cuff Large Adult (Manual) Each Curaplex 7.17$           20.19$        
Emergency Blanket - 58" X 90" Disposable Each Curaplex / 16570 1.81$           4.78$           
Emesis Bag - Blue w/plastic ring Case of 144 Curaplex/  1071-10204 12.50$        107.88$      
Extrication Collar Perfit ACE Adult Adjustable Each Ambu 4.10$           7.83$           

Extrication Collar Perfit ACE Mini (Pedi) Adjustable Each Ambu 4.10$           7.83$           
Gloves, POWDER FREE, NITRLE, NON-LATEX Box/Case 5.60$           No Bid

Glucose Meter - Fora GD20 Blood Glucose #2761-20011 Each Links Medical products, Inc -$             2.41$           

Glucose Test Strips - Fora GD20 Test Strips 50 bottle Btl Links Medical products, Inc 9.00$           9.63$           
Solution Control Blood Glucos HI/LO Fora GD20 Set Links Medical products, Inc 8.53$           7.83$           



GLUTOSE 15GM GRAPE - 3/PACK  (12/cs) Pkg of 3 *ANY flavor is ok 12.32$        11.31$        
Head Blocks, Disposable  Adult Each Curaplex 3.93$           3.98$           
Head Blocks, Disposable  Child 4.00$           3.98$           
Head Blocks, Disposable   Infant 4.00$           3.98$           
Instant Cold Pack 7in x 7.5 Box of 24 Curaplex #1431-77000 0.37$           11.98$        
Instant Hot Packs  6.69in L x 7.5 in W Box of 24 Curaplex # 1432-67000 0.44$           8.27$           
Isolation Gown, Fluid Resistant, Full back Each 0.69$           0.70$           
Lancets SurgiLance® , Safety Lancets 21g  2.8mm pink/ 
or 2.2 mmD (Orange) Box of 100 Medipurpose 11.11$        10.03$        
Lubricating Jelly Packets 2.7gm Box of 144 Curaplex 4.48$           7.27$           
Nail Polish Remover Pads Box of 100 Dynarex 6.12$           4.13$           
Nose Clip, Plastic Each Airlife / 792-9-01344-44 0.58$           0.71$           

Obstetrical Kit- Needs to include: 1 pair Disposable 
Sterile Latex Gloves, 1 drape sheet, 2 umbilical Clamps 
sterile, 2 OB Towelettes, 1 Disposable Scalpel Sterile, 1 
Sterile OB PAD, 1 receiving blanket, 6 sterile Guaze 
Sponges, 1 sterile bulb syringe, 4 Each Curaplex / 540-1727EA-A 8.82$           10.42$        
Peroxide, Hydrogen 16 oz  (12 BTL/CS) Each Medique Products /25711 3.27$           1.03$           
QuikClot® Combat Hemostatic Gauze 3in x 4 yd Strip  Z-
fold Each Teleflex 30.00$     35.18$        106.31$      
Razor - Gallant Prep Razon # 4251 Box of 50 Dynarex 0.40$           22.73$        

SAM Splint, Wrist, Orange/Blue, Flatfold,  4.25x9 Each Sam Medical 3.04$           24.60$        
SAM Splint, Extra Wide, Orange, Flatfold, 5.5x36 Each Sam Medical 7.75$           8.18$           
SAM Splint, Flatfold, 4.25 X 18 Each Sam Medical 8.17$           13.59$        

Sani-Cloth Plus Germicidal Wipes 6"x 6.75" 160/tub Each PDI 6.97$           5.94$           
Sharps Container 1 qt Transportable Item #29303 Each IT has other manufacturer 4.78$           1.14$           
Sharps Container 5 qt MDS705153 Each Med Plus Services USA 5.41$           3.59$           
Sharps Shuttle (curaplex Sharps Solo, compact size, 6.5 
in) Each Curaplex / 64250 1.40$           1.76$           
Shears, Trauma (7.25in ) Each Curaplex 0.67$           2.37$           
Shoe Covers Box of 50 0.23$           0.26$           
Ferno Pedi-Mate Plus Restraint System each Ferno 395.49$      520.05$      
Pedi Board with Case each Curpalex 80.00$        39.29$        
Professional Intubation mini-bag RED Each Ferno 90.26$        65.62$        
Sterile Burn Sheets, 60"X96" Each Curaplex 2.06$           3.69$           
Sterile Water for irrigation 500 ml Each 3.21$           2.15$           
Stethoscope Adscope® 603 Clinician Adult, 31in L, Royal 
Blue Each Adscope 32.33$        35.19$        

Stethoscope Adscope® 604 Clinician Pediatric, Black
Each Adscope 38.12$        39.98$        

Thermometer - Welch Allyn Sure Temp 690 EA Welch Allyn 331.22$      23.80$        
Thermometer Oral Probe - Sure Temp 690 EA Welch Allyn 331.22$      100.26$      

Thermometer Rectal Probe - Sure Temp 690 - w/well EA Welch Allyn 101.59$      326.87$      
Thermometer Probe Covers (250/sl) #05031 Each Welch Allyn 9.40$           9.44$           
Titan Reusable Bariatric Stretcher Each Taylor Medical 60.62$        No Bid
Tourniquet, tactical Black, Combat Application Each North American Rescue 27.78$        26.19$        
Urinal w/cover (disposable) each Medline Industries 0.62$           3.79$           

Smart Triag Pack, Illinos/North Carolina Specification Each Kingfisher Medical, Inc 175.49$      No Bid
Lactated Ringers 500 ml bag Each 2.99$           4.43$           
Model 65 Scoop stretcher without Restraints Each Ferno Washington 484.10$      774.12$      
Normal Saline 500 ml Each 2.85$           No Bid
EPI - - VIAL - - 1:1000  25ea/pk PK 466.67$      No Bid
Dextrose 5% - 100 ml bag 2.51$           3.70$           
D 5 W 250 ml bag 4.91$           4.44$           
D 10 250 ml bag 2.90$           5.23$           
Chest Seal,  HYFIN Twin Pack 2/Each North American Rescue, LLC 15.00$        14.47$        
Israeli Emergency Bandage, Green  4 inch Each Safeguard Medical 7.65$           4.16$           Quote-not preferred
Israeli Emergency Bandage, Green  8 inch 15.63$        4.16$           Quote-not preferred
Portable Suction 463.37$      166.01$      Quote-not preferred
Rico Suction Bags Rico Suction Labs, Inc. 28.21$        No Bid
KED Extrication Device Each Curaplex 59.00$        57.74$        
Traction Splints Each Curaplex 160.00$      639.33$      
ECG Electrodes, Medi-Trace 530, 30/pouch Pk Kendall 3.16$           No Bid
ECG Electrodes, Pediatric - Huggables 30/box Bx Conmed 8.35$           8.30$           
QUIK-COMBO REDI-PAK DEFIB - ADULT Each (10/bx) 31.54$        No Bid
QUIK-COMBO REDI-PAK DEFIB - PEDI Each (10/bx) 38.89$        No Bid
LP-15 ECG Paper 100mm wide 2 rolls/pk pk 1.53$           No Bid
Microstream Smart CapnoLine Plus O2 - Adult box of 100 Oridion 7.46$           No Bid
Microstream Smart CapnoLine Plus O2 - Pediatric box of 25 Oridion 8.78$           No Bid

Microstream FilterLine Set Adult-Pediatric CO2 
Sampling Line and Airway Adapter (End Tidal) box of 25 Oridion 6.34$           No Bid      
Neonatal/Adult SpO2 Sensor box of 20 Masimo #1860 12.98$        264.77$      
Masimo Pulse OX  Patientcable - Rainbow RC-4  4' use 
w/Rainbow & M-LNCS Sensor EA Masmio 2406 96.00$        132.38$      

Masimo M-LNCS DC-1 Reusable Sensor - SPO2 Adult EA Masimo 2501 144.00$      144.42$      
12 Lead ECG Cable Trunk Cable w/4 Wire Limb Leads  5 
ft EA 450.07$      504.53$      
12 lead ECG cable 6-wire precordial  attachment EA 181.24$      203.43$      



NIBP Tubing, Coiled Hose, Bayonet Connection EA 109.07$      122.65$      
NIBP - Reusable Cuff - Infant EA 26.29$        26.01$        
NIBP - Reusable Cuff - Pediatric EA 29.22$        10.98$        
NIBP - Reusable Cuff - Adult EA 36.17$        27.38$        
NIBP - Reusable Cuff - Large Adult EA 57.00$        20.19$        
NIBP - Reusable Cuff - X-Large Adult EA 58.39$        21.66$        

TOTAL ITEMS BID ON: 49.00$  1 ITEM 196.05$  29 ITEMS 6,412.12$   213 items 6,189.40$   185 items

Please Disclose shipping policies and pricing
ALL PRODUCTS MUST BE LATEX FREE
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